ORDINANCE 2012 - 3

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE 2011 - 49, ARTICLE II,
CHAPTER 8, SECTIONS 19-21 OF THE MT. JULIET MUNICIPAL
CODE TO ADOPT THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE AND RELATED CODES

WHEREAS, Tenn. Code Annotated §§’s 6-54-501 through 6-54-511 authorizes municipalities to adopt building,
electrical, and fire codes by reference; and,

WHEREAS, the City of Mt. Juliet Board of Commissioners are of the opinion that it is necessary for the health,
safety, and welfare of the citizens of Mt. Juliet, Tennessee, to adopt the 2012 Edition of the International Building
Code, regulating the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings, and structures; by providing the
standards for the supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure
buildings that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and
structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures in the City of Mt. Juliet; and
providing for issuance of permits and collections of fees.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City Commission of City of Mt. Juliet, Wilson County,
Tennessee, as follows:

Section 1. Article II, Chapter 8, Sections 19-21 of the Mt. Juliet Municipal Code is amended by deleting
the current Article II, Chapter 8, Sections 19-21 in their entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the
following sections:

CHAPTER 1 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE ADOPTED

8-19. Adoption of International Building Code. The International Building Code, 2012 Edition and other
adopted codes, one (1) copy is on file in the Office of the Building Official in the Public Works Department
of the City of Mt. Juliet, as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the
official building code of the City of Mt. Juliet for regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance
of all property buildings and structures; by providing the standard for supplied utilities and facilities and
other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for
occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use
and the demolitions of such structures in the City of Mt. Juliet; and providing for the issuance of permits
and collection of fees; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of the
International Building Code are hereby adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance,
with the additions prescribed in Section §-20.

8-20. Additional Codes Adopted. The following additional cods are hereby adopted:

2012 Edition of International Residential Code; plus Appendices A, B,C,E,F, G, H,L ], K, M, N, O, P
and Q; and amended as follows;

1. Section R101.1, Insert “City of Mt. Juliet Tennessee” in “Name of Jurisdiction”,

2. Table R301.2(1) adding the following Snow Load “10#”, wind speed “90”, Seismic “B”,
weathering “severe”, Frost Line Depth, 6, Termite “Moderate to Heavy”, Winter design temperature
“14°F”, Ice Barrier Required, “No”, Flood Hazards, “As shown on FEMA FIRM Panel , Dated , Air
Freezing Index “1500 or less”, and Mean Annual Temperature “57°F”.

3. Section 303.4 Add the following language to the end of the code section to read, “...or
approved air exchanger on the HVAC System which will make up the required ventilation.”



4, Section R313.2 Remove and replace the words, “one-and two-family dwellings” with “all
residential dwellings except, Single-Family Dwellings”

5. Section P2503.5.1 Remove the words, “Other than plastic”

2012 Edition of International Building Code; plus appendices A, B, C, E, F, G H, I, J, and K; and amended
as follows:

1. Section 1013.8, change “36” inches to “24” inches

2012 Edition of International Mechanical Code plus Appendix A

2012 Edition of International Plumbing Code plus Appendices B, C, D, E, and F

2012 Edition of International Existing Building Code plus Appendix A, B and Resource A

2012 Edition of International Fuel Gas Code plus Appendices A, B, C, and D

2012 Edition of International Property Maintenance Code

2012 Edition of International Fire Code plus Appendices A, B,C,D, E,F, G, H, I, andJ

2012 Edition of International Energy Conservation Code as amended as follows:
1. Replace Table C402.2 with Table 502.2(1) & (2) from the 2006 Edition of the IECC
2. Replace Table R402.1.1 with Table 402.1.1 from the 2006 Edition of the IECC

2012 Edition to Life Safety Code plus Annexes A, B, and C

2009 ICC/ANSI Al17.1 and the 2010 Edition of the Americans with Disabilities Act for Accessibility
Code

2012 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code

2008 ICC-500 Construction of Storm Shelters

2007 ICC-400 Construction of Log Homes

2012 ICC-300 Construction of Bleachers, Folding and Telescopic Seating, and Grandstands

2011 Edition of the National Electrical Code, (NFPA 70) is adopted by reference.

Article 90 through Chapter 9 inclusive are adopted and incorporated into this chapter as the
technical section of the electrical code of the City of Mt Juliet, by reference, as fully as though
copied into this chapter.

The City of Mt Juliet’s adoption of the 2011 NEC is hereby amended by the following:
Amendments to the National Electrical Code.

A. Section 100.1 of the 2011 Edition of the National Electrical Code is amended by deleting the
definition of Authority Having Jurisdiction and substituting the following:

Authority Having Jurisdiction - The Chief Building Official of the City of Mt Juliet.

B. Section 210.12(A) of the 2011 Edition of the National Electrical Code is amended by deleting
Section 210.12(A) and substituting the following:

1.  210.12 Arc-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection.

(A) Dwelling Units. All 120-volt, single phase, 15- and 20-ampere branch circuits supplying
outlets installed in dwelling unit bedrooms shall be protected by a listed arc-fault circuit
interrupter, combination-type, installed to provide protection of the branch circuit.



Informational Note No. 1: For information on types of arc-fault circuit interrupters, see UL 1699-
1999, Standard for Arc-Fault Circuit Interrupters.

Informational Note No. 2: See 11.6.3(5) of NFP4 72-2010, National Fire Alarm and Signaling
Code, for information related to secondary power supply requirements for smoke alarms installed
in dwelling units.

Informational Note No. 3: See 760.41(B) and 760.121(B) for power-supply requirements for fire
alarm systems.

Exception No. 1: If RMC, IMC, EMT, Type MC, or steel armored Type AC cables meeting the
requirements of 250.118 and metal outlet and junction boxes are installed for the portion of the
branch circuit between the branch circuit overcurrent device and the first outlet, it shall be
permitted to install an outlet branch-circuit type AFCI at the first outlet to provide protection for
the remaining portion of the branch circuit.

Exception No. 2: Where a listed metal or nonmetallic conduit or tubing is encased in not less than
50 mm (2 in.) of concrete for the portion of the branch circuit between the branch-circuit
overcurrent device and the first outlet, it shall be permitted to install an outlet branch-circuit type
AFCI at the first outlet to provide protection for the remaining portion of the branch circuit.

Exception No. 3: Where an individual branch circuit to a fire alarm system installed in
accordance with 760.41(B) or 760.121(B) is installed in RMC, IMC, EMT, or steel sheathed
cable, Type AC or Type MC, meeting the requirements of 250.118, with metal outlet and junction
boxes, AFCI protection shall be permitted to be omitted.

8-21. Penalty. It shall be illegal for any person to violate any provision of a code adopted by the City of
Mt. Juliet. Violations shall be punished by a fine not to exceed Fifty Dollars ($50.00). Each day that a
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED

In case of conflict between this ordinance or any part hereof, and the whole or part of any existing ordinance of the
City, the most restrictive code provision will apply, If any section, clause, provision or portion of this ordinance is
held to be invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such holding shall not affect any other
section, clause, provision or portion of this ordinance.

That nothing in this ordinance or in the International Building Codes hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any
suit or proceedings pending in any, court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of
action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed, not shall nay just or legal right, remedy of
any character be lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance.

This ordinance shall take effect on the earliest date allowed by law.

PASSED: g%ﬂ““}

Ed Hagerts',' quor
FIRST READING: 5 ) ! ’\” 12
SECOND READING: it =

"N S At

Sheila S. Luckett, CMC
City Recorder

)t

APPROVED AS TO FORM: M
‘\____P% Kenny Magg#ft Interim City Manager

Jasgh Holleman




8-20. Additional Codes Adopted. The following additional cods are hereby adopted:

2012 Edition of International Residential Code; plus Appendices A, B, C,E,F, G, H, [ J, K, M, N, O, P
and Q; and amended as follows;

1. Section R101.1, Insert “City of Mt. Juliet Tennessee” in “Name of Jurisdiction”,

R101.1 Title.

These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings of

INAME-OF-JURISPICHON] City of Mt. Juliet Tennessee, and shall be cited as such and will be
referred to herein as “this code.”

Table R301.2(1) adding the following Snow Load “10#”, wind speed “90”, Seismic “B”,
weathering “severe”, Frost Line Depth, 67, Termite ‘“Moderate to Heavy”, Winter design temperature
“14°F”, Ice Barrier Required, “No”, Flood Hazards, “As shown on FEMA FIRM Panel , Dated , Air
Freezing Index “1500 or less”, and Mean Annual Temperature “S7°F”.

TABLE R301.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

GROUND WIND DESIGN SEISMIC SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM WINTER ICE BARRIER FLOOD AR MEAN
SNOW 3T Torogranic DESIGN e DESIGN | UMDERLAYMENT o | FREEZING | ANNUAL
LOAD | Speed pog CATEGORY' : e| Temp® REQUIRED" HAZARDS woex' | TEm®

(mph) effocts” Weathering deDthb Termite QUIRED
10 90 NA B SEVERE 6" Mod to Ilvy| 1£F NO SEE FIRM | 1,500 or Less| S7°F
3. Section 303.4 Add the following language to the end of the code section to read, “...or

approved air exchanger on the HVAC System which will make up the required ventilation.”

R303.4 Mechanical ventilation.

Where the air infiltration rate of a dwelling unit is less than S air changes per hour when tested
with a blower door at a pressure of 0.2 inch w.c (50 Pa) in accordance with Section N1102.4.1.2, the
dwelling unit shall be provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation in accordance with Section
M1507.3 or approved air exchanger on the HVAC System which will make up the required ventilation.

4. Section R313.2 Remove and replace the words, “one-and two-family dwellings” with “all
residential dwellings except, Single-Family Dwellings”

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems.

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in ene—and-twe-family-dwellings:
all residential dwellings except one- and two-family dwellings.

5. Section P2503.5.1 Remove the words, “Other than plastic”

P2503.5.1 Rough plumbing.

DWYV systems shall be tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water or for piping

systems other-than-plastie, by air with no evidence of leakage. Either test shall be applied to
the drainage system in its entirety or in sections after rough piping has been installed, as
follows:




Water test. Each section shall be filled with water to a point not less than 10 feet above the
highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest point in the completed system.
Water shall be held in the section under test for a period of 15 minutes. The system shall
prove leak free by visual inspection.

Air test. The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge pressure of 5 pounds per
square inch (psi) or 10 inches of mercury column. This pressure shall be held without
introduction of additional air for a period of 15 minutes.

2012 Edition of International Building Code; plus appendices A, B, C, E, F, G H, 1, J, and K; and amended

Section 1013.8, change “36” inches to “24” inches

2.
as follows:
1.
1013.8 Window sills.

In Occupancy Groups R-2 and R-3, one- and two-family and multiple-family dwellings, where the
opening of the sill portion of an operable window is located more than 72 inches above the finished
grade or other surface below, the lowest part of the clear opening of the window shall be at a height
not less than 36-24 inches above the finished floor surface of the room in which the window is

located. Operable sections of windows shall not permit openings that allow passage of a 4-inch-

diameter sphere where such openings are located within 36 24 inches of the finished floor.

2012 Edition of International Energy Conservation Code as amended as follows:

1. Replace Table C402.2 with Table 502.2(1) & (2) from the 2006 Edition of the IECC
TABLE C402.2
OPAQUE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS®
e | | 1 3 4 EXCEPT MARINE SAND MARINES | ¢ [ 7 | 3
- zuzlumlmn[umlmn[umlmn mother | GroupR W asotner | Grovpm | asotner | croupr | asotner | Group | asotner | Groupr
ROOTS

m"“-“'m"""’ R-20ct R-20ct R-20ct R-20ct R-20ct R-2008 R-25at 2508 R250 R-25c X0 300 R-350t R35¢1 R-35a1 R-351
(RS m! R-19+ R-19+ R-19+ R-19+ R-19+ R-19+ R-19+ R-19+ n-19+ R-19+ R-25+ R-25+ R-30+ R0+ R-30+ R-0+
o RS | mtes | mines | mRanas | mares | manes fomans | mes B ratis | omais | maies | mats | manes | omais | omans | omates
ARG 200 omRr 3 -3 R32 3 LX) 38 L8] R R-38 (¥} L] R-i9 R49 R R R4

VValis, AbOVe Grade
Mase REe | RET LYI LET™ e R4 50 rese | mie f Renee | omedse | omeasa | Res2o | mes2e | mesae | R2se R-250t
et r-13+ R134+ R13+ R13+ R134 R34 R134 n134 R-134 R34 R-13+ R134+ R134 R4 R134 R-13+
bing REse | RES RE5a R-13ct RS0 R13a R-1301 R-13ct R13d R-13t R13t R-132t rid | muese | mse | Resa
Metat Yamed R34+ L RETS R34+ R13+ R13+ R13+ 134+ R13+ RA3+ R13+ R-134 R-134+ R134 RT3+ n134 R+
L RS0t et R7.50H 7501 R-7501 R75¢ RTS8 n-7.50 n75e R75¢ R7S¢ rR7s8 | As6d | R7sa | mi7se
R-13+ R-13+ R-13+ R-13+ K134+ R-13+ R-13+
Wood Yamed and 13+ R3¢ R-13+ R-13+ R-13+ R-13+ R-13+ R-13+ R-13+ Y _750 RT501 R7Sa R-750 R-186c4 R-186c1
i Risaor | m3scior | RSscor | m3scor | R R33 R-38 R3320 nsas | ST | o raee | araos | araes | wnacs | oemans | omaos

R R0 0 n20 or2 | on2 f§ orn | ar2 f arx

R3¢ R-3Act R33 R38 R33ci _-10ct R-10c8

\iatis, Below Grade
Besow-grace was® | NR J NR I NR | NR I NR I NR R75¢! LEX" RTS8 r75a l R7.5¢1 I LT | R-1081 I R-102! | R-10ct I R-128d

FIoors

Mass NR NR R$.3 R R-1001 R-1001 mie | raa | mos | mazse | omezse | mezsa risa | mera | Rase | Rt
Josvaaning NR NR L5 LX) ¥ LX) X ~x X R0 LX) RXE Rt Rt Rt Rt

ab-on-Grade Fioors
mone | moiooe ll miome | moome | moome | moasee [ moasee | omasor | masee | omzowr
Unheaied siaoe NR N NR R b MR 2 betow | 2 veiow [l 2 veiow | 24 pelow | 20 beiow | 20 vetow | 2 oeiow | 247 veiow | 20 oeiow | 24~ verow
g rRsor | RIS | R7Sme | mase | omatwe | meome §omeasor | mesoc [omeasoe | measmoe | omasee | m2ome [ me2omr | m20me | om0 | R-20me
Hedted siate 12 beiow | 12"beiow | t:"pelow | 13 oewow | 20 oeow | 20"peiow [ 2¢-beiow | 2 veiow [ 3 oelow | e-peow | deoeiow | 4ebeiow | 20-veow | 45 peiow | a2 peiow | 48 beow

Doors

Sungwg U061 U061 U061 U0t U081 U061 U081 U-061 uasr uaw Uo7 U037 u-a37 way vos u-aw
Rol-p or saang R4TS R4TS R4TS R4TS L9 LTS RTS 4TS R4.7S R4TS RA4TS R-47S R-4.7S R-4.7S R47S RTS




TABLE 502.2(1)

BUILDING ENVELOPE REQUIREMWQUE ASSEMBLIES
4

except 5 and
CUMATE ZONE 1 2 3 Marine | Marine 4 6 7 8
Roofs
Insulation entirely above deck | R-15ci R-15 ¢i R-15¢ci R-15 ci R-20 ci R-20 ci R25¢i | R25ci
Metal buidings (with R-5 R-19 + R-19 R-19 R-19 R-19 R-19 R19+ | R19+
thermal blocks')* R-10 R-10 R-10
Attic and other R-30 R-30 R-30 R-30 R-30 R-30 R-38 R-38
Walls, Above Grade
Mass NR NR R57ce*] R57cr | R76ci | R95ci | R-114c |R133ci
Metal buiding R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13+ R13+ R13+ | RA3+
R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13
Metal framed R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13+ R-13+ R13+ | R13+
R-38ci | R38ci | R75c | R75¢ci
Wood framed and other R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13 R-13 +
R-75 ci
Walis, Below Grade
Below grade wal® NR NR NR NR MR | NR | R75ci | R75d
Floors
Mass NR R5ci R-5 ci R-10 ci R-10 ci R10ci | R15¢i | R15ci
Joist/Framing NR R-19 R-19 R-19 R-19 R-30 R-30 R-30
Siab-on-Grade Floors
Unheated slabs NR NR NR NR NR NR NR R-10
for 24 in.
belows
Hested slabs R-75 R7S R75 R-75 R75 R-10 R-10 R-10
for12in. | for12in. | for12in. J| for12in. f for24in. | for36in. | for36in. | for 48 in.
below below below below below below below below
Opaque Doors
Swinging U-070 | U-070 | u-070 § U-070 JU-070 | U-070 | U-070 | U-0.50
Rolk-up or sliding U-145 | U-145 | u-145f U-145 JU-145 | U—0S50 | U-050 |u-050
2. Replace Table R402.1.1 with Table 402.1.1 from the 2006 Edition of the IECC
TABLE R402.1.1
IMSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENT S BY COMPONENT"
CRAWL
GLAZED WOOD MASS & a4
TION b 0O0R BASEMENT SLAB ¢
Crone | oenoront | Jouow’ | rewestanon | SRS | rRAMEwAu | WAL | UOCR walL | Rvales | GOIFE
SHGC RVALUE F-VALUE F-VALUE DEPTH FVALUE
1 NR 0.75 0.25 30 13 4 13 0 (i 0
2 0.40 0.65 0.25 38 13 48 13 0 ° 0
3 0.35 0.55 0.25 38 20 or 13458" 8/13 19 513" 0 513
TR —
4 excapt " 7 19 1013 10,2 1013
Marine 0.35 0.55 0.40 49 20 or 1345 8/13 )
5 and n g 1519
Marine 4 0.32 0.55 NR 43 20 or 1348 1317 30 15/19 10.2H 5/
] 0.32 0.55 NR 49 2045 or 13+10" 1520 209 15/19 10,41 15119
7and8 0.32 0.55 NR 49 20+5 or 13+10" 19721 389 15/18 10,41 15/19




TABLE 402.1.1
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT?

GLAZED wooD MASS BASEMENTe | SLABd CRAWL
CLIMATE | FENESTRATION | SKYLIGHTb | FENESTRATION | CEILING | FRAMEWALL | WALL FLOOR WALL R-VALUE SPACEc
ZONE LFACTOR U-FACTOR SHGC R-VALUE R-VALUE R-VALUE| R-VALUE A-VALUE | & DEPTH | WALL R-VALUE
1 1.20 0.75 0.40 30 13 3 13 0 0 0
2 0.75 0.75 0.40 30 13 4 13 0 0 0
W N— - —

13 19

or

6 0.35 0.60 NR 49 19 or 13+5° 15 30 10/13 10,41 10713
7Tand B 0.35 0.60 NR 49 21 19 ki 10713 10,4 R 10713




SUBIJECT: An Ordinance to Adopt the 2012 Edition of the Suite of International and other
codes.

WHO: Board of Commissioners

WHAT: The City of Mt. Juliet, acting through the Building and Codes Division of Public Works
adopts rules and regulations for the following building related activities: new building
construction, building revisions and/or modifications, plumbing, mechanical, demolition,
swimming pool, fire code system, structure moving, construction inspection, and plans review
to support said building construction, modification and/or revision activities. This Ordinance
provides for the following:

a). replaces the current adopted codes to the 2012 Suite of codes as published by the
International Code Council;

b).brings our adopted codes to a standard that will not affect our 1SO Building Division
Rating;

c). codification of other related ordinances into a single document.

WHEN: May9, 2012

WHERE: N/A

WHY: Current Building Codes as adopted by the City of Mt. Juliet are now out of date and
should be brought current. The ISO (Insurance Services Office) has informed us by not adopting

these codes we will have our I1SO Rating dropped by at least 2 points.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION: Staff Recommends that the Board of Commissioners approve the
Ordinance.

Prepared By: Dwayne Hicks, Chief Building and Fire Code Official





